
-~-Beginning-~- 
 
Gooooood Morning SILVER TRAIL! This is Lila coming to you from the 
WSTM Live studio! Today is Thursday, March 12th, 2020.  
_____________________   
Good Morning! This is Catherine with your announcements  
for today. The affirmation for today is: I peacefully resolve conflicts. 
_____________________ 
Students, please make sure your ID's are on and visible at this time. 
_____________________ 
For today's science word, you will hear the definition and try to guess the 
word. The definition is: The maximum absolute variation of any periodic 
function. (Wait 5 seconds.) Did you guess? The word is: Amplitude.  
_____________________ 
From Ms. Barreto and Ms. Capullo, there will be a HOPE club meeting on 
Monday, March 16th at 8:15 AM in room 170. Please make sure you are on 
time. If you are an officer, it is imperative that you attend. This is a meeting 
for ALL members. If you are unable to attend, you must notify Ms. Barreto 
or Ms. Capullo.  
_____________________ 
March is Women's History Month. In honor of this observance, let's listen 
to Martina Becerril from Mrs. Saunig's Debate Class with a declamation 
speech, originally done by Malala Yousafzai after she was shot exercising 
her right to be educated as a female in Pakistan. 
_____________________ 
Our Staff Book Fair Winner for today is: Mrs. Quintero. 
______________________ 
We are experiencing a network issue district wide. Expect slow and or 
unresponsive internet connections. 
_____________________  
That's it for today: Have a Thrilling Thursday Silver Trail! 
_____________________ 
 
 


